
[[SW1025903 ODDONOTTO]] VOLVO A40 340462 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP432130
Oil Type: ATF
Job No: SW1025903 ODDONOTTO

ARNOLD MACHINERY COMPANY4323 EAST WINSLOW AVENUEPHOENIX, AZUS  85040Contact: RANDY PRZEKURATrandyp@arnoldmachinery.comT: F: (602)414-1904
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the fluid. Thecondition of the fluid is acceptablefor the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO6174Unique No: 10727818Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 08 Nov 2023
Report Id: VOLVO6174 [WUSCAR] 05999458 (Generated: 11/08/2023 10:42:30) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RANDY PRZEKURAT - VOLVO6174

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP432130 VCP303311 VCP277999 ---Sample Date 27 Oct 2023 03 Sep 2021 28 Apr 2020 ---Machine Hours 8810 7733 6275 ---Oil Hours 0 0 0 ---Oil Changed Changed Not Changd Changed ---Sample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 27.7 26.6 26.3 ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 3 4 5 ---Sodium ppm 3 2 4 ---Potassium ppm <1 0 <1 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 14 20 27 ---Copper ppm 10 17 22 ---Lead ppm 0 0 0 ---Tin ppm <1 1 3 ---Aluminum ppm 11 13 16 ---Chromium ppm 0 0 <1 ---Molybdenum ppm 0 <1 <1 ---Nickel ppm 1 <1 4 ---Titanium ppm 0 0 0 ---Silver ppm 0 0 0 ---Manganese ppm 0 <1 <1 ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 64 68 81 ---Magnesium ppm 0 0 <1 ---Zinc ppm 7 10 14 ---Phosphorus ppm 166 132 160 ---Barium ppm 0 0 0 ---Boron ppm 87 60 65 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO6174 [WUSCAR] 05999458 (Generated: 11/08/2023 10:42:33) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RANDY PRZEKURAT - VOLVO6174
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40 340462\Transmission (Auto) [VCP432130] 27 Oct 2023 @ 8810.0 hrs

