
[[W02007688]] VOLVO A35G 340132 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP426062
Oil Type: MOBIL 15W40
Job No: W02007688

MCCLUNG-LOGAN EQUIPMENT CO - MANASSAS8450 QUARRY ROADMANASSAS, VAUS  20110Contact: MIKE MAYHUGHMMAYHUGH@MCCLUNG-LOGAN.COMT: (703)393-7344F: (703)393-7844
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of the coolant leak. Check forlow coolant level. Oil and filterchange at the time of sampling hasbeen noted. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor thiscondition.All component wear ratesare normal. Sodium and/orpotassium levels are high. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil.

Depot: VOLVO0002Unique No: 10727902Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 08 Nov 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0002 [WUSCAR] 05999542 (Generated: 11/08/2023 13:19:32) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MIKE MAYHUGH - VOLVO0002

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP426062 VCP419405 VCP396513 VCP277891Sample Date 03 Nov 2023 15 Jun 2023 13 Mar 2023 26 Apr 2021Machine Hours 9978 9559 9100 5941Oil Hours 500 500 500 0Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.4 12.4 12.7 13.1Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 8.2 7.1 10.3 ---Oxidation (PA) % 63 51 81 59
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.2 0.3 0.3 0.3Nitration (PA) % 63 69 71 71Sulfation (PA) % 62 55 62 56Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 0.5 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 8 5 17 3Sodium ppm 314 274 87 3Potassium ppm 40 39 35 4
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 7 7 62 12Copper ppm 1 <1 <1 3Lead ppm 0 0 <1 1Tin ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 5 1 7 6Chromium ppm <1 0 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 130 42 50 5Nickel ppm <1 0 <1 <1Titanium ppm <1 0 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 0 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1630 2109 1714 1844Magnesium ppm 586 158 498 543Zinc ppm 1000 1093 1087 1051Phosphorus ppm 829 917 909 929Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 229 14 34 47

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0002 [WUSCAR] 05999542 (Generated: 11/08/2023 13:19:35) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MIKE MAYHUGH - VOLVO0002
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A35G 340132\Diesel Engine [VCP426062] 03 Nov 2023 @ 9978.0 hrs

