
VOLVO EC220E 314027 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP424006
Oil Type: VOLVO VDS-4.5 Premium Motor Oil 15W40
Job No:

ULSTER COUNTY RESOURCE RECOVERY AGENCY999 FLATBUSH AVEKINGSTON, NYUS  12401Contact: CHARLES WHITTAKERcwhf@ucrra.netT: (845)399-2686F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: ULSKINUnique No: 10728031Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 08 Nov 2023
Report Id: ULSKIN [WUSCAR] 05999671 (Generated: 11/08/2023 11:18:27) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CHARLES WHITTAKER - ULSKIN

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP424006 VCP404692 VCP323031 VCP303778Sample Date 30 Oct 2023 27 Apr 2023 21 Sep 2021 15 Apr 2021Machine Hours 7650 6997 4100 3159Oil Hours 0 700 500 600Oil Changed N/A Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 13.5 13.6 13.3 13.8Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 8.9 8.7 --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 96 88 90 97
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.2 0.2 0.2 0.2Nitration (PA) % 80 78 67 73Sulfation (PA) % 64 58 62 65Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 20 13 20 16Sodium ppm 2 3 3 4Potassium ppm 0 1 0 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 17 12 8 12Copper ppm <1 <1 <1 2Lead ppm 0 0 <1 1Tin ppm <1 0 <1 1Aluminum ppm 12 7 10 9Chromium ppm 1 2 <1 1Molybdenum ppm 43 48 45 45Nickel ppm <1 <1 <1 1Titanium ppm <1 <1 0 <1Silver ppm 0 0 <1 <1Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 <1
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1786 1708 1867 1882Magnesium ppm 576 561 573 550Zinc ppm 1255 1184 1033 988Phosphorus ppm 1032 930 848 816Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 27 35 28 36

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: ULSKIN [WUSCAR] 05999671 (Generated: 11/08/2023 11:18:30) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CHARLES WHITTAKER - ULSKIN
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC220E 314027\Diesel Engine [VCP424006] 30 Oct 2023 @ 7650.0 hrs

