
VOLVO A45G 342095 - WET DISC BRAKE

Sample No: VCP425096
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No:

SAIIA CONSTRUCTION LLC4400 LEWISBURG RDBIRMINGHAM, ALUS  35207Contact: STEPHANI BRITTONsbritton@saiia.com;doug.bogart@wearcheck.comT: (205)943-2268F: (205)943-2269
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.The ironlevel is abnormal. The copper level isabnormal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: SAIBIRUnique No: 10729182Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 09 Nov 2023
Report Id: SAIBIR [WUSCAR] 06000822 (Generated: 11/13/2023 02:32:12) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEPHANI BRITTON - SAIBIR

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP425096 VCP366718 VCP374599 VCP349265Sample Date 26 Oct 2023 18 Aug 2022 31 May 2022 28 Dec 2021Machine Hours 8727 6994 6468 5946Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Not Changd Changed Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 53.0 43.3 43.8 44.4
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 14 15 15 19Sodium ppm <1 4 2 0Potassium ppm 1 0 1 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 32 28 34 38Copper ppm 142 323 309 334Lead ppm 0 <1 0 <1Tin ppm 0 <1 0 <1Aluminum ppm 2 2 1 2Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 3 <1 0 <1Nickel ppm 2 6 2 6Titanium ppm <1 0 0 <1Silver ppm 0 <1 0 0Manganese ppm <1 1 1 1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3185 3136 3324 3521Magnesium ppm 32 9 9 8Zinc ppm 1348 1350 1433 1379Phosphorus ppm 1121 1165 1258 1218Barium ppm 5 <1 0 0Boron ppm 88 124 99 107

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SAIBIR [WUSCAR] 06000822 (Generated: 11/13/2023 02:32:16) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEPHANI BRITTON - SAIBIR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A45G 342095\Wet Disc Brake [VCP425096] 26 Oct 2023 @ 8727.0 hrs

