
[[621191 CARDINAL AGG]] VOLVO EC350 314509 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP432708
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: 621191 CARDINAL AGG

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY - METRO WEST56195 PONTIAC TRAILNEW HUDSON, MIUS  48165Contact: PAUL CONZpaul.conz@altg.comT: (313)348-8861F: (248)356-2029
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.The copper level hasdecreased, but is still abnormal. Thereis no indication of any contaminationin the oil. The oil viscosity is lowerthan normal. The BN result indicatesthat there is suitable alkalinityremaining in the oil. Confirm oil type.

Depot: VOLVO2990Unique No: 10729739Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 09 Nov 2023
Report Id: VOLVO2990 [WUSCAR] 06001379 (Generated: 11/12/2023 16:25:47) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PAUL CONZ - VOLVO2990

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP432708 VCP412652 --- ---Sample Date 20 Oct 2023 07 Aug 2023 --- ---Machine Hours 925 608 --- ---Oil Hours 500 608 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Changed --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.0 10.3 --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 7.1 5.1 --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 60 70 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.1 0.1 --- ---Nitration (PA) % 62 88 --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 54 61 --- ---Glycol % NEG NEG --- ---Fuel % <1.0 0.7 --- ---Silicon ppm 6 30 --- ---Sodium ppm 2 2 --- ---Potassium ppm 1 4 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 4 14 --- ---Copper ppm 74 202 --- ---Lead ppm 2 4 --- ---Tin ppm <1 2 --- ---Aluminum ppm 1 2 --- ---Chromium ppm 0 0 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 60 83 --- ---Nickel ppm 0 0 --- ---Titanium ppm <1 3 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm <1 3 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1211 2228 --- ---Magnesium ppm 870 53 --- ---Zinc ppm 1100 1229 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1007 972 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 0 23 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO2990 [WUSCAR] 06001379 (Generated: 11/12/2023 16:25:50) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PAUL CONZ - VOLVO2990
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC350 314509\Diesel Engine [VCP432708] 20 Oct 2023 @ 925.0 hrs

