
[[632549 ASH GROVE]] VOLVO L180 5492 - FRONT AXLE

Sample No: VCP432927
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER WET BRAKE TRANSAXLE OIL WB102
Job No: 632549 ASH GROVE

ALTA EQUIPMENT/FLAGLER EQUIPMENT LLC9601 BOGGY CREEK RDORLANDO, FLUS  32824Contact: Robert LaPlanterobert.laplante@altg.comT: (407)508-9736F: (407)659-8720
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0096Unique No: 10735628Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 09 Nov 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0096 [WUSCAR] 06001866 (Generated: 11/12/2023 16:26:02) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Robert LaPlante - VOLVO0096

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP432927 --- --- ---Sample Date 02 Nov 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 12219 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 43.3 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 12 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 1 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 55 --- --- ---Copper ppm 18 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3688 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 19 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1458 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1175 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 125 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0096 [WUSCAR] 06001866 (Generated: 11/12/2023 16:26:04) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: Robert LaPlante - VOLVO0096
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L180 5492\Front Axle [VCP432927] 02 Nov 2023 @ 12219.0 hrs

