
[[13730]] VOLVO A45G 353552 - COOLANT

Sample No: VCP415468
Oil Type: VOLVO COOLANT VCS (YELLOW)
Job No: 13730

MCCLUNG-LOGAN EQUIPMENT CO - RICHMOND1345 MOUNTAIN ROADGLEN ALLEN, VAUS  23060Contact: KYLE RATLIFFEKRATLIFFE@MCCLUNG-LOGAN.COMT: F: (804)266-1611
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. The fluid is suitable forfurther service. No evidence of oilpresent in the coolant. There is noindication of any contamination inthe coolant. Carboxylate test failed.The glycol level is acceptable. The pHlevel of this fluid is within theacceptable limits.

Depot: VOLVO8882Unique No: 10735801Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 21 Nov 2023
Report Id: VOLVO8882 [WUSCAR] 06002039 (Generated: 11/21/2023 16:58:08) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KYLE RATLIFFE - VOLVO8882

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP415468 --- --- ---Sample Date 31 Oct 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 339 --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 COOLANT CONDITIONpH Scale 0-14 8.32 --- --- ---Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 --- --- --- ---Nitrites ppm NT --- --- ---Percentage Glycol % 43.6 --- --- ---Freezing Point °C -19 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONCoolant Appearance normal --- --- ---Coolant Color Yllow --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8882 [WUSCAR] 06002039 (Generated: 11/21/2023 16:58:10) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KYLE RATLIFFE - VOLVO8882
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A45G 353552\Coolant [VCP415468] 31 Oct 2023 @ 339.0 hrs

