
VOLVO L120F 66538 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP395413
Oil Type: PETRO CANADA 10W30
Job No:

WOODBED CORP dba DELULLO TRUCKING1022 DELAUM RDST MARYS, PAUS  15857Contact: CRYSTAL WILLIAMScrystal@woodbed.comT: (814)834-1464F: (814)834-9588
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: WOOSTMUnique No: 10737059Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 10 Nov 2023
Report Id: WOOSTM [WUSCAR] 06003297 (Generated: 11/12/2023 13:16:21) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CRYSTAL WILLIAMS - WOOSTM

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP395413 VCP373522 VCP327806 VCP302785Sample Date 03 Nov 2023 28 Aug 2022 03 Mar 2022 12 Aug 2021Machine Hours 2707 2391 2085 1786Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 11.9 12.2 12.0 11.7Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 7.6 8.4 7.4 ---Oxidation (PA) % 66 73 67 78
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.3 0.3 0.3 0Nitration (PA) % 66 69 63 68Sulfation (PA) % 58 63 58 70Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 4 4 4 1Sodium ppm 4 <1 2 3Potassium ppm 6 2 9 7
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 6 6 7 6Copper ppm 2 2 2 1Lead ppm <1 0 <1 <1Tin ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Aluminum ppm <1 2 1 1Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 19 7 3 7Nickel ppm 0 0 0 0Titanium ppm 0 <1 0 0Silver ppm 0 <1 0 0Manganese ppm <1 0 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1934 2103 2402 2388Magnesium ppm 234 49 28 82Zinc ppm 1218 1142 1300 1242Phosphorus ppm 1005 957 1064 1020Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 125 193 178 182

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: WOOSTM [WUSCAR] 06003297 (Generated: 11/12/2023 13:16:24) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CRYSTAL WILLIAMS - WOOSTM
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L120F 66538\Diesel Engine [VCP395413] 03 Nov 2023 @ 2707.0 hrs

