
VOLVO A45G 353552 - GEARBOX

Sample No: VCP418012
Oil Type: VOLVO WB 102
Job No:

MCCLUNG-LOGAN EQUIPMENT CO - RICHMOND1345 MOUNTAIN ROADGLEN ALLEN, VAUS  23060Contact: KYLE RATLIFFEKRATLIFFE@MCCLUNG-LOGAN.COMT: F: (804)266-1611
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of the coolant leak. Werecommend that you drain the oilfrom the component if this has notalready been done. We recommendan early resample to monitor thiscondition.All component wear ratesare normal. Test for glycol is positive.There is a high concentration ofwater present in the oil. The oil is nolonger serviceable due to thepresence of contaminants.

Depot: VOLVO8882Unique No: 10737592Signed: Doug BogartReport Date: 22 Nov 2023
Report Id: VOLVO8882 [WUSCAR] 06003830 (Generated: 11/22/2023 13:39:55) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KYLE RATLIFFE - VOLVO8882

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP418012 --- --- ---Sample Date 08 Nov 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 339 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 44.1 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.827 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 23 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 34 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 40 --- --- ---Copper ppm 423 --- --- ---Lead ppm 1 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 1 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 4 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 0 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 3 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3843 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 12 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1389 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1363 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 134 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8882 [WUSCAR] 06003830 (Generated: 11/22/2023 13:39:57) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KYLE RATLIFFE - VOLVO8882
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A45G 353552\Gearbox [VCP418012] 08 Nov 2023 @ 339.0 hrs

