
[[2023-1011382]] VOLVO A45G 79 (S/N 342558) - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP405327
Oil Type: VOLVO AT 102
Job No: 2023-1011382

J.M. HUBER10322 HWY 53 EMARBLE HILL, GAUS  30148Contact: GEORGE GIBSONgeorge.gibson@huber.comT: (770)893-7602F: 
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Nocorrective action is recommended atthis time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Moderate concentration of visibledirt/debris present in the fluid. Thecondition of the fluid is acceptablefor the time in service.

Depot: JMHMARUnique No: 10737641Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 14 Nov 2023
Report Id: JMHMAR [WUSCAR] 06003879 (Generated: 11/15/2023 06:49:42) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: GEORGE GIBSON - JMHMAR

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP405327 VCP396277 VCP325082 ---Sample Date 01 Oct 2023 04 Feb 2023 03 Aug 2021 ---Machine Hours 12523 10737 7401 ---Oil Hours 500 0 0 ---Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ---Sample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 27.9 28.3 26.1 ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 6 6 10 ---Sodium ppm 2 3 10 ---Potassium ppm 2 3 3 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 34 20 122 ---Copper ppm 11 8 68 ---Lead ppm 0 0 0 ---Tin ppm 1 <1 7 ---Aluminum ppm 11 6 36 ---Chromium ppm 0 0 <1 ---Molybdenum ppm 0 <1 3 ---Nickel ppm <1 <1 8 ---Titanium ppm 0 0 0 ---Silver ppm 0 0 0 ---Manganese ppm <1 <1 2 ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 76 72 161 ---Magnesium ppm 0 2 30 ---Zinc ppm 0 3 62 ---Phosphorus ppm 180 188 204 ---Barium ppm 0 0 0 ---Boron ppm 88 91 68 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: JMHMAR [WUSCAR] 06003879 (Generated: 11/15/2023 06:49:45) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: GEORGE GIBSON - JMHMAR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A45G 79 (S/N 342558)\Transmission (Auto) [VCP405327] 01 Oct 2023 @ 12523.0 hrs

