
[[23-05]] VOLVO A45G 342634 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP149476
Oil Type: DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 40
Job No: 23-05

GLOVER CONSTRUCTION CO. INC.4493 US HWY 301 NPLEASANT HILL, NCUS  27866Contact: BRENDA GAYbgay@gloverconstruction.comT: F: (252)536-5078
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor. Please specify the brand,type, and viscosity of the oil on yournext sample.All component wearrates are normal. Fuel contentnegligible. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: GLOPLEUnique No: 10737806Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 14 Nov 2023
Report Id: GLOPLE [WUSCAR] 06004044 (Generated: 11/15/2023 19:25:25) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRENDA GAY - GLOPLE

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP149476 VCP216303 VCP150388 VCP210968Sample Date 18 Oct 2023 16 Jun 2022 15 Feb 2022 05 Aug 2020Machine Hours 3010 1946 1517 505Oil Hours 606 429 515 503Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.3 13.0 12.6 10.7Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 7.1 7.0 7.2 ---Oxidation (PA) % 52 41 47 88
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.4 0.3 0.4 0.2Nitration (PA) % 68 64 70 60Sulfation (PA) % 53 52 57 68Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % 0.6 <1.0 <1.0 0.2Silicon ppm 4 4 5 24Sodium ppm <1 1 2 4Potassium ppm 2 0 0 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 16 11 16 27Copper ppm 6 27 93 189Lead ppm <1 1 5 1Tin ppm <1 1 1 0Aluminum ppm 3 2 2 2Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 1Molybdenum ppm 41 6 10 39Nickel ppm 2 1 <1 4Titanium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 <1Manganese ppm 0 <1 <1 2Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1569 2244 2368 1674Magnesium ppm 565 81 148 481Zinc ppm 1155 994 1043 1039Phosphorus ppm 976 818 951 953Barium ppm 7 0 0 2Boron ppm 4 5 4 43

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: GLOPLE [WUSCAR] 06004044 (Generated: 11/15/2023 19:25:29) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BRENDA GAY - GLOPLE
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A45G 342634\Diesel Engine [VCP149476] 18 Oct 2023 @ 3010.0 hrs

