
[[SPM621711 BL DUKE]] SENNEBOGEN 835ME 835.0.2810 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP416909
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER HYDRAULIC OIL 46
Job No: SPM621711 BL DUKE

ALTA EQUIPMENT CO - ORLAND PARK5000 INDUSTRIAL HWYGARY, INUS  46406Contact: DAVE ENGDAVE.ENG@ALTG.COMT: (312)350-2560F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.There is a high amount of silt(particulates < 14 microns in size)present in the oil. The AN level isacceptable for this fluid. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: VOLVO8885Unique No: 10737964Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 14 Nov 2023
Report Id: VOLVO8885 [WUSCAR] 06004202 (Generated: 11/15/2023 17:49:50) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAVE ENG - VOLVO8885

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP416909 VCP383254 VCP380525 VCP365817Sample Date 18 Oct 2023 09 Mar 2023 17 Feb 2023 19 Oct 2022Machine Hours 6955 5516 5387 4582Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Not Changd Not Changd Changed Not ChangdSample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 40.6 41.4 42.6 41.5Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.92 0.67 0.79 0.81
 CONTAMINATIONParticles >4µm 10450 2784 3967 12884Particles >6µm 2247 351 799 1944Particles >14µm 65 15 68 109ISO 4406:1999 (c) 21/18/13 19/16/11 19/17/13 21/18/14Silicon ppm 2 2 2 1Sodium ppm 5 2 3 <1Potassium ppm <1 0 0 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 1 3 2 3Copper ppm 3 2 2 2Lead ppm <1 0 0 <1Tin ppm 0 0 0 <1Aluminum ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Nickel ppm <1 0 0 0Titanium ppm <1 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 <1Manganese ppm <1 0 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 908 493 476 337Magnesium ppm 79 97 85 100Zinc ppm 821 772 660 792Phosphorus ppm 683 636 546 622Barium ppm 0 0 0 2Boron ppm 10 8 7 3

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8885 [WUSCAR] 06004202 (Generated: 11/15/2023 17:49:53) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAVE ENG - VOLVO8885
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	SENNEBOGEN SENNEBOGEN 835ME 835.0.2810\Hydraulic System [VCP416909] 18 Oct 2023 @ 6955.0 hrs

