
[[SPM621611]] SENNEBOGEN 835 835.0.2465 - FRONT LEFT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP440565
Oil Type: GEAR OIL SAE 80W90
Job No: SPM621611

ALTA EQUIPMENT CO - ORLAND PARK5000 INDUSTRIAL HWYGARY, INUS  46406Contact: DAVE ENGDAVE.ENG@ALTG.COMT: (312)350-2560F: 
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of water entry. Werecommend that you drain the oilfrom the component if this has notalready been done. We recommendan early resample to monitor thiscondition.All component wear ratesare normal. There is a highconcentration of water present in theoil. The oil is no longer serviceabledue to the presence of contaminants.

Depot: VOLVO8885Unique No: 10738392Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 14 Nov 2023
Report Id: VOLVO8885 [WUSCAR] 06004630 (Generated: 11/14/2023 16:27:10) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAVE ENG - VOLVO8885

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP440565 VCP404486 --- ---Sample Date 18 Oct 2023 11 Apr 2023 --- ---Machine Hours 8621 7962 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd Changed --- ---Sample Status SEVERE NORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 111 183 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 1.20 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 10 3 --- ---Sodium ppm <1 8 --- ---Potassium ppm 4 1 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 35 236 --- ---Copper ppm 3 29 --- ---Lead ppm <1 0 --- ---Tin ppm <1 0 --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 2 --- ---Chromium ppm <1 2 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 9 <1 --- ---Nickel ppm 0 <1 --- ---Titanium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm <1 9 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1414 27 --- ---Magnesium ppm 641 5 --- ---Zinc ppm 989 78 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 716 1135 --- ---Barium ppm 0 297 --- ---Boron ppm 100 2 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8885 [WUSCAR] 06004630 (Generated: 11/14/2023 16:27:12) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DAVE ENG - VOLVO8885
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	SENNEBOGEN SENNEBOGEN 835 835.0.2465\Front Left Final Drive [VCP440565] 18 Oct 2023 @ 8621.0 hrs

