
[[HILLSBOROUGH CITY]] VOLVO L70H 632864 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP429375
Oil Type: DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 15W40
Job No: HILLSBOROUGH CITY

ALTA EQUIPMENT/FLAGLER CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT LLC8418 PALM RIVER ROADTAMPA, FLUS  33619Contact: KENNY HANEYkhaney@flaglerce.comT: (813)630-0077F: (813)630-2233
Diagnosis
We advise that you check the airfilter, air induction system, and anyareas where dirt may enter thecomponent. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Elemental levels of silicon (Si) andaluminum (Al) indicate alumina-silicate (coarse dirt) ingress. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0093Unique No: 10739022Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 15 Nov 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 06005260 (Generated: 11/15/2023 13:41:40) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KENNY HANEY - VOLVO0093

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP429375 VCP389359 --- ---Sample Date 09 Oct 2023 19 Oct 2022 --- ---Machine Hours 8172 825 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed N/A N/A --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 13.5 13.2 --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 9.2 10.4 --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 71 81 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.5 0.3 --- ---Nitration (PA) % 76 74 --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 57 63 --- ---Glycol % NEG NEG --- ---Fuel % <1.0 <1.0 --- ---Silicon ppm 29 16 --- ---Sodium ppm 2 4 --- ---Potassium ppm 2 2 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 22 228 --- ---Copper ppm 1 7 --- ---Lead ppm 3 5 --- ---Tin ppm 1 2 --- ---Aluminum ppm 24 16 --- ---Chromium ppm 1 7 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 58 31 --- ---Nickel ppm <1 <1 --- ---Titanium ppm 0 <1 --- ---Silver ppm <1 <1 --- ---Manganese ppm <1 7 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 <1 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1000 1654 --- ---Magnesium ppm 921 490 --- ---Zinc ppm 1283 1099 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1068 884 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 45 46 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 06005260 (Generated: 11/15/2023 13:41:43) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KENNY HANEY - VOLVO0093
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L70H 632864\Diesel Engine [VCP429375] 09 Oct 2023 @ 8172.0 hrs

