
VOLVO EC480 315121 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP441859
Oil Type: DIESEL ENGINE OIL SAE 15W40
Job No:

ALTA EQUIPMENT/FLAGLER CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT LLC8418 PALM RIVER ROADTAMPA, FLUS  33619Contact: KENNY HANEYkhaney@flaglerce.comT: (813)630-0077F: (813)630-2233
Diagnosis
We recommend you service the filterson this component. Resample at thenext service interval to monitor. Wewere unable to perform a particlecount due to a high concentration ofparticles present in this sample.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Moderate concentration of visibledirt/debris present in the oil. Confirmoil type. The AN level is acceptablefor this fluid. The condition of the oilis suitable for further service.

Depot: VOLVO0093Unique No: 10739253Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 15 Nov 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 06005491 (Generated: 11/16/2023 14:53:29) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KENNY HANEY - VOLVO0093

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP441859 VCP422873 --- ---Sample Date 13 Oct 2023 30 Jun 2023 --- ---Machine Hours 0 511 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed N/A Not Changd --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 42.1 42.6 --- ---Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.44 0.45 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONParticles >4µm --- 18998 --- ---Particles >6µm --- 2653 --- ---Particles >14µm --- 67 --- ---ISO 4406:1999 (c) --- 21/19/13 --- ---Silicon ppm 4 2 --- ---Sodium ppm <1 0 --- ---Potassium ppm <1 0 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm <1 <1 --- ---Copper ppm 9 7 --- ---Lead ppm 0 0 --- ---Tin ppm 0 0 --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 0 --- ---Chromium ppm 0 0 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 0 --- ---Nickel ppm 0 0 --- ---Titanium ppm 0 0 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 0 0 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 <1 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 65 93 --- ---Magnesium ppm 0 0 --- ---Zinc ppm 541 538 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 397 432 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 0 0 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 06005491 (Generated: 11/16/2023 14:53:31) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KENNY HANEY - VOLVO0093
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC480 315121\Hydraulic System [VCP441859] 13 Oct 2023 @ .0 hrs

