
VOLVO EC350EL 310135 - FRONT LEFT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP429884
Oil Type: GEAR OIL LS 80W90
Job No:

TRAFALGAR HOMES OF TEXASPO BOX 65STEPHENVILLE, TXUS  76401Contact: MEGAN LETHERWOODmegleatherwood7@gmail.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
We advise that you check all areaswhere dirt can enter the system. Werecommend that you drain the oilfrom the component if this has notalready been done. We advise thatyou inspect for the source(s) of wear.We recommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.Highconcentration of visible metalpresent. Gear wear is indicated.Elemental levels of silicon (Si) andaluminum (Al) indicate alumina-silicate (coarse dirt) ingress. The oil isno longer serviceable as a result ofthe abnormal and/or severe wear.

Depot: TRASTETXUnique No: 10739705Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 15 Nov 2023
Report Id: TRASTETX [WUSCAR] 06005943 (Generated: 11/15/2023 14:30:32) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MEGAN LETHERWOOD - TRASTETX

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP429884 --- --- ---Sample Date 06 Nov 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 2280 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 130 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.093 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 504 --- --- ---Sodium ppm <1 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 13 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 2179 --- --- ---Copper ppm 4 --- --- ---Lead ppm 2 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 51 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 14 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 2 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 4 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 17 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 360 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 18 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 32 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 890 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 138 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: TRASTETX [WUSCAR] 06005943 (Generated: 11/15/2023 14:30:34) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MEGAN LETHERWOOD - TRASTETX
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC350EL 310135\Front Left Final Drive [VCP429884] 06 Nov 2023 @ 2280.0 hrs

