
[[SWO-067073]] VOLVO A45G 352702 - BRAKE COOLING SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP428896
Oil Type: TRANSAXLE OIL SAE 75W80
Job No: SWO-067073

SAIIA CONSTRUCTION LLC4400 LEWISBURG RDBIRMINGHAM, ALUS  35207Contact: STEPHANI BRITTONsbritton@saiia.com;doug.bogart@wearcheck.comT: (205)943-2268F: (205)943-2269
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Nocorrective action is recommended atthis time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Anincrease in the copper level is noted.All other component wear rates arenormal. There is no indication of anycontamination in the fluid. Thecondition of the fluid is acceptablefor the time in service.

Depot: SAIBIRUnique No: 10739710Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 15 Nov 2023
Report Id: SAIBIR [WUSCAR] 06005948 (Generated: 11/15/2023 15:23:01) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEPHANI BRITTON - SAIBIR

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP428896 VCP329993 VCP290232 ---Sample Date 07 Nov 2023 13 Jan 2022 02 Aug 2021 ---Machine Hours 3950 983 456 ---Oil Hours 0 0 0 ---Oil Changed Changed Not Changd Not Changd ---Sample Status ATTENTION NORMAL NORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 40.0 39.9 40.1 ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 21 18 16 ---Sodium ppm 10 6 13 ---Potassium ppm <1 <1 1 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 22 13 10 ---Copper ppm 127 22 3 ---Lead ppm 1 0 <1 ---Tin ppm <1 0 0 ---Aluminum ppm 2 2 0 ---Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Molybdenum ppm 0 <1 <1 ---Nickel ppm 6 3 3 ---Titanium ppm 0 0 <1 ---Silver ppm 0 0 0 ---Manganese ppm 1 <1 <1 ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3162 3767 4167 ---Magnesium ppm 11 9 8 ---Zinc ppm 1447 1568 1534 ---Phosphorus ppm 1286 1260 1366 ---Barium ppm 0 0 0 ---Boron ppm 107 115 156 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SAIBIR [WUSCAR] 06005948 (Generated: 11/15/2023 15:23:04) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: STEPHANI BRITTON - SAIBIR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A45G 352702\Brake Cooling System [VCP428896] 07 Nov 2023 @ 3950.0 hrs

