
VOLVO L120H 632540 - FRONT AXLE

Sample No: VCP433761
Oil Type: VOLVO WB 102
Job No:

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY5151 DR MARTIN LUTHER KING BLVDFORT MYERS, FLUS  33905Contact: TODD LARKtlark@altaequipfl.comT: F: (239)481-3302
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Gear wearis indicated. All other componentwear rates are normal. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0090Unique No: 10740991Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 16 Nov 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0090 [WUSCAR] 06007229 (Generated: 11/17/2023 14:06:03) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TODD LARK - VOLVO0090

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP433761 VCP418563 VCP312048 ---Sample Date 09 Nov 2023 31 Jul 2023 21 Jun 2021 ---Machine Hours 13618 12544 5391 ---Oil Hours 0 0 0 ---Oil Changed Not Changd Changed Not Changd ---Sample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 68.8 288 45.4 ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 23 25 21 ---Sodium ppm 5 <1 10 ---Potassium ppm 0 0 1 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 620 950 376 ---Copper ppm 2 6 1 ---Lead ppm 0 0 <1 ---Tin ppm 0 0 <1 ---Aluminum ppm <1 2 0 ---Chromium ppm 5 6 2 ---Molybdenum ppm 9 13 4 ---Nickel ppm 2 3 1 ---Titanium ppm 0 <1 <1 ---Silver ppm 0 0 0 ---Manganese ppm 15 16 5 ---Vanadium ppm 0 <1 <1 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2539 220 4093 ---Magnesium ppm 16 22 12 ---Zinc ppm 1034 124 1562 ---Phosphorus ppm 1125 1023 1336 ---Barium ppm 0 0 0 ---Boron ppm 119 136 210 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0090 [WUSCAR] 06007229 (Generated: 11/17/2023 14:06:06) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TODD LARK - VOLVO0090
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L120H 632540\Front Axle [VCP433761] 09 Nov 2023 @ 13618.0 hrs

