
[[633493]] VOLVO A45G 353505 - FRONT AXLE

Sample No: VCP432950
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 85W-140 GL-5
Job No: 633493

ORANGE COUNTY SOLID WASTE5901 YOUNG PINE ROADORLANDO, FLUS  32829Contact: MICHAEL BEEBEmichael.beebe@ocfl.netT: (407)836-6652F: (407)836-6650
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The oilviscosity is lower than normal.Confirm oil type.

Depot: ORAORLUnique No: 10741667Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 16 Nov 2023
Report Id: ORAORL [WUSCAR] 06007905 (Generated: 11/16/2023 21:44:09) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MICHAEL BEEBE - ORAORL

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP432950 --- --- ---Sample Date 09 Nov 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 1583 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status ATTENTION --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 52.8 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONSilicon ppm 8 --- --- ---Sodium ppm <1 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 6 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 485 --- --- ---Copper ppm 5 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 7 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 4 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm <1 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 15 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 143 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 2 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 63 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 2401 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 181 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: ORAORL [WUSCAR] 06007905 (Generated: 11/16/2023 21:44:11) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MICHAEL BEEBE - ORAORL
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A45G 353505\Front Axle [VCP432950] 09 Nov 2023 @ 1583.0 hrs

