
[[W07013732-1 CEC]] AVANT 745 7136013748 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP432685
Oil Type: AW HYDRAULIC OIL ISO 46
Job No: W07013732-1 CEC

MCCLUNG-LOGAN EQUIPMENT CO - RICHMOND1345 MOUNTAIN ROADGLEN ALLEN, VAUS  23060Contact: KYLE RATLIFFEKRATLIFFE@MCCLUNG-LOGAN.COMT: F: (804)266-1611
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Nocorrective action is recommended atthis time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.The ironlevel is abnormal. All othercomponent wear rates are normal.There is a high amount of silt(particulates < 14 microns in size)present in the oil. The AN level isacceptable for this fluid. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO8882Unique No: 10742034Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 17 Nov 2023
Report Id: VOLVO8882 [WUSCAR] 06008272 (Generated: 11/17/2023 12:05:27) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KYLE RATLIFFE - VOLVO8882

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP432685 VCP391465 --- ---Sample Date 10 Nov 2023 27 Oct 2022 --- ---Machine Hours 1504 1256 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Changed --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 42.6 39.6 --- ---Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.30 0.498 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONParticles >4µm 56590 159721 --- ---Particles >6µm 3455 21419 --- ---Particles >14µm 20 54 --- ---ISO 4406:1999 (c) 23/19/11 24/22/13 --- ---Silicon ppm 4 9 --- ---Sodium ppm <1 0 --- ---Potassium ppm <1 2 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 33 78 --- ---Copper ppm 1 3 --- ---Lead ppm 0 1 --- ---Tin ppm 0 0 --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 3 --- ---Chromium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 <1 --- ---Nickel ppm 0 0 --- ---Titanium ppm 0 0 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm <1 2 --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 71 57 --- ---Magnesium ppm 6 <1 --- ---Zinc ppm 470 407 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 356 340 --- ---Barium ppm 0 2 --- ---Boron ppm 0 8 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8882 [WUSCAR] 06008272 (Generated: 11/17/2023 12:05:30) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KYLE RATLIFFE - VOLVO8882
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	AVANT AVANT 745 7136013748\Hydraulic System [VCP432685] 10 Nov 2023 @ 1504.0 hrs

