
[[24415]] VOLVO L220H 3130 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP420550
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: 24415

218 - ASCENDUM MACHINERY INC - N. CHARLESTON7235 CROSS COUNTRY RD.NORTH CHARLESTON, SCUS  29418Contact: MATT MITCHAMmatt.mitcham@ascendummachinery.comT: F: (843)414-1129
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Oil and filter change atthe time of sampling has been noted.Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The oilviscosity is lower than normal. TheBN result indicates that there issuitable alkalinity remaining in the oil.Confirm oil type.

Depot: VOLVO3387Unique No: 10743048Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 19 Nov 2023
Report Id: VOLVO3387 [WUSCAR] 06009286 (Generated: 11/19/2023 12:28:27) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MATT MITCHAM - VOLVO3387

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP420550 VCP405645 VCP425747 VCP401778Sample Date 10 Nov 2023 07 Aug 2023 19 May 2023 16 Feb 2023Machine Hours 11602 10822 10086 8984Oil Hours 1000 1000 1000 1000Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status ATTENTION ATTENTION NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.4 11.6 12.9 13.1Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 9.5 9.2 8.9 6.4Oxidation (PA) % 76 63 82 94
 CONTAMINATIONSoot % % 0.2 0.2 0.3 0.9Nitration (PA) % 60 60 73 93Sulfation (PA) % 58 53 60 67Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 0.3 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 5 4 4 4Sodium ppm 4 0 2 3Potassium ppm 2 0 3 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 5 5 7 4Copper ppm 1 0 2 <1Lead ppm <1 0 2 <1Tin ppm <1 0 1 <1Aluminum ppm 2 <1 3 0Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 34 24 38 42Nickel ppm <1 0 <1 <1Titanium ppm <1 1 <1 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 0 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 <1 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1629 2254 1794 1628Magnesium ppm 476 429 531 521Zinc ppm 1075 1317 1165 1144Phosphorus ppm 900 1031 890 935Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 31 35 27 49

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO3387 [WUSCAR] 06009286 (Generated: 11/19/2023 12:28:31) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MATT MITCHAM - VOLVO3387
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L220H 3130\Diesel Engine [VCP420550] 10 Nov 2023 @ 11602.0 hrs

