
[[W02007731]] VOLVO A40E 13778 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP418741
Oil Type: MOBIL 15W40
Job No: W02007731

MCCLUNG-LOGAN EQUIPMENT CO - MANASSAS8450 QUARRY ROADMANASSAS, VAUS  20110Contact: MIKE MAYHUGHMMAYHUGH@MCCLUNG-LOGAN.COMT: (703)393-7344F: (703)393-7844
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.All componentwear rates are normal. There is amoderate amount of fuel present inthe oil. Tests confirm the presence offuel in the oil. The BN result indicatesthat there is suitable alkalinityremaining in the oil. Fuel is present inthe oil and is lowering the viscosity.The oil is no longer serviceable dueto the presence of contaminants.

Depot: VOLVO0002Unique No: 10743053Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 20 Nov 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0002 [WUSCAR] 06009291 (Generated: 11/20/2023 09:52:26) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MIKE MAYHUGH - VOLVO0002

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP418741 VCP395660 --- ---Sample Date 10 Nov 2023 13 Dec 2022 --- ---Machine Hours 10142 9894 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Changed --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL ATTENTION --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 11.4 12.0 --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 7.0 9.3 --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 52 63 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % <0.1 <0.1 --- ---Soot % % 0.2 0.3 --- ---Nitration (PA) % 65 63 --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 49 57 --- ---Glycol % NEG NEG --- ---Fuel % 3.6 2.5 --- ---Silicon ppm 3 1 --- ---Sodium ppm 3 0 --- ---Potassium ppm 0 3 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 2 6 --- ---Copper ppm 2 3 --- ---Lead ppm <1 <1 --- ---Tin ppm <1 <1 --- ---Aluminum ppm 3 1 --- ---Chromium ppm 0 0 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 66 42 --- ---Nickel ppm <1 0 --- ---Titanium ppm 0 0 --- ---Silver ppm 0 1 --- ---Manganese ppm <1 <1 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2051 1633 --- ---Magnesium ppm 75 426 --- ---Zinc ppm 1177 1104 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1018 962 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 66 54 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0002 [WUSCAR] 06009291 (Generated: 11/20/2023 09:52:29) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MIKE MAYHUGH - VOLVO0002
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40E 13778\Diesel Engine [VCP418741] 10 Nov 2023 @ 10142.0 hrs

