
[[FLYWAY]] VOLVO EC220EL 310218 - REAR RIGHT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP415280
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 85W-140 GL-5
Job No: FLYWAY

HIGHWAY EQUIPMENT AND SUPPLY CO200 BURKHOLDER DR.EPHRATA, PAUS  17522Contact: CHAD HERRONchad@hwyequip.comT: (717)859-3132F: (717)859-2698
Diagnosis
We advise that you check all areaswhere dirt can enter the system. Weadvise that you check for the sourceof water entry. The oil change at thetime of sampling has been noted. Weadvise that you inspect for thesource(s) of wear. We recommend anearly resample to monitor thiscondition.The iron level is severe.Gear wear is indicated. Elementallevels of silicon (Si) and aluminum(Al) indicate alumina-silicate (coarsedirt) ingress. There is a highconcentration of water present in theoil. The oil is no longer serviceabledue to the presence of contaminants.

Depot: INSEPHUnique No: 10750327Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 21 Nov 2023
Report Id: INSEPH [WUSCAR] 06011183 (Generated: 11/21/2023 10:07:51) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CHAD HERRON - INSEPH

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP415280 VCP368180 VCP331569 VCP292921Sample Date 18 Nov 2023 17 Feb 2023 24 Nov 2021 02 Nov 2020Machine Hours 0 5055 3927 2888Oil Hours 0 0 2000 0Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status SEVERE SEVERE SEVERE ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 375 62.5 228 103
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 12.3 24.3 NEG NEGSilicon ppm 4142 587 1552 209Sodium ppm 64 4 35 6Potassium ppm 174 11 156 13
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 12146 2137 3423 846Copper ppm 25 7 8 2Lead ppm 2 <1 2 <1Tin ppm 0 0 0 0Aluminum ppm 557 50 364 48Chromium ppm 85 18 22 6Molybdenum ppm 12 2 5 <1Nickel ppm 12 3 3 <1Titanium ppm 54 3 33 4Silver ppm 0 <1 5 <1Manganese ppm 75 13 25 5Vanadium ppm 2 <1 1 <1
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 241 45 238 29Magnesium ppm 123 6 101 12Zinc ppm 14 36 51 0Phosphorus ppm 844 1934 1270 1411Barium ppm 1 0 2 0Boron ppm 100 56 147 233

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: INSEPH [WUSCAR] 06011183 (Generated: 11/21/2023 10:07:54) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CHAD HERRON - INSEPH
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC220EL 310218\Rear Right Final Drive [VCP415280] 18 Nov 2023 @ .0 hrs

