
[[467]] HAMM 0914 - DRUM GEARBOX

Sample No: VCP413812
Oil Type: DRYDENE 80W90
Job No: 467

TOTAL DEVELOPMENT SOLUTIONS LLC7805 PROGRESS CTGAINESVILLE, VAUS  20155Contact: JOE SEALEjseale@totaldevelopmentsolutions.comT: (703)222-0497F: (703)753-4586
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. We advisethat you inspect for the source(s) ofwear. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor thiscondition.Bearing and/or gear wear isindicated. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The oilis no longer serviceable as a result ofthe abnormal and/or severe wear.

Depot: TOTGAIUnique No: 10750869Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 22 Nov 2023
Report Id: TOTGAI [WUSCAR] 06011725 (Generated: 11/22/2023 13:10:56) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOE SEALE - TOTGAI

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP413812 --- --- ---Sample Date 09 Oct 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 2312 --- --- ---Oil Hours 500 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 107 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 30 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 6 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 1599 --- --- ---Copper ppm 181 --- --- ---Lead ppm 3 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 4 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 16 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 2 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 3 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 9 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 14 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 4 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 245 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1282 --- --- ---Barium ppm 4 --- --- ---Boron ppm 40 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: TOTGAI [WUSCAR] 06011725 (Generated: 11/22/2023 13:11:00) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOE SEALE - TOTGAI
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	HAMM HAMM 0914\Drum Gearbox [VCP413812] 09 Oct 2023 @ 2312.0 hrs

