
[[467]] HAMM 0914 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP413815
Oil Type: SHELL ROTELLA T 15W40
Job No: 467

TOTAL DEVELOPMENT SOLUTIONS LLC7805 PROGRESS CTGAINESVILLE, VAUS  20155Contact: JOE SEALEjseale@totaldevelopmentsolutions.comT: (703)222-0497F: (703)753-4586
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: TOTGAIUnique No: 10751256Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 21 Nov 2023
Report Id: TOTGAI [WUSCAR] 06012112 (Generated: 11/21/2023 09:51:30) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOE SEALE - TOTGAI

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP413815 --- --- ---Sample Date 09 Nov 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 2312 --- --- ---Oil Hours 500 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 13.1 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 7.3 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 71 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Soot % % 0.3 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 77 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 65 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % <1.0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 16 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 0 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 5 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 35 --- --- ---Copper ppm 4 --- --- ---Lead ppm 1 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 6 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 2 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 170 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm <1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1756 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 546 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1144 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 902 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 112 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: TOTGAI [WUSCAR] 06012112 (Generated: 11/21/2023 09:51:34) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOE SEALE - TOTGAI
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	HAMM HAMM 0914\Diesel Engine [VCP413815] 09 Nov 2023 @ 2312.0 hrs

