
[[SWA410173-30]] NOT GIVEN VCP419922 - SWA40173-30 (S/N NO INFO GIVEN) - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP419922
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: SWA410173-30

ALTA EQUIPMENT COMPANY5210 REESE ROADDAVIE, FLUS  33314Contact: GERMAN BLANDONgblandon@flaglerce.comT: (954)581-4744F: (954)583-0318
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor. The fluidwas not specified, however, a fluidmatch indicates that this fluid is SAE30 Diesel Engine Oil.  Please confirmthe oil type and grade, and specifythe brand of the oil on your nextsample. Please specify thecomponent make and model withyour next sample.All component wearrates are normal. Fuel contentnegligible. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: VOLVO0095Unique No: 10751300Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 22 Nov 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0095 [WUSCAR] 06012156 (Generated: 11/22/2023 12:58:01) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: GERMAN BLANDON - VOLVO0095

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP419922 --- --- ---Sample Date 16 Nov 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed N/A --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.1 --- --- ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 7.2 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 95 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Soot % % 0.1 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 94 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 64 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % 0.2 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 12 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 3 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 5 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 18 --- --- ---Copper ppm 133 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 45 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 2 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1940 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 474 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1139 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 882 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 21 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0095 [WUSCAR] 06012156 (Generated: 11/22/2023 12:58:05) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: GERMAN BLANDON - VOLVO0095
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	NOT GIVEN VCP419922 - SWA40173-30 (S/N NO INFO GIVEN)\Diesel Engine [VCP419922] 16 Nov 2023 @ .0 hrs

