
[[W06005791]] GRADALL XL4100V 414000351 - DROP BOX

Sample No: VCP420888
Oil Type: MOBIL MOBILFLUID 424
Job No: W06005791

MCCLUNG-LOGAN EQUIPMENT CO - SALEM2025 COOK DRIVESALEM, VAUS  24153Contact: HUNTER TRIVELLINttrivellin@mcclung-logan.comT: (540)789-3750F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Thealuminum level is abnormal. All othercomponent wear rates are normal.There is no indication of anycontamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO9010Unique No: 10751910Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 22 Nov 2023
Report Id: VOLVO9010 [WUSCAR] 06012766 (Generated: 11/22/2023 13:56:28) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: HUNTER TRIVELLIN - VOLVO9010

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP420888 --- --- ---Sample Date 14 Nov 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 2069 --- --- ---Oil Hours 500 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 54.8 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 55 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 8 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 2 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 86 --- --- ---Copper ppm 2 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 19 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 3 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 1 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3054 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 24 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1184 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1062 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 116 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO9010 [WUSCAR] 06012766 (Generated: 11/22/2023 13:56:31) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: HUNTER TRIVELLIN - VOLVO9010
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	GRADALL GRADALL XL4100V 414000351\Drop Box [VCP420888] 14 Nov 2023 @ 2069.0 hrs

