
[[621032 APTIM]] VOLVO A35G 340083 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP432140
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: 621032 APTIM

ALTA EQUIPMENT/FLAGLER CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT LLC8418 PALM RIVER ROADTAMPA, FLUS  33619Contact: JOHN FARDELLAjohn.fardella@altg.comT: (813)630-0077F: (813)630-2233
Diagnosis
We advise that you check the airfilter, air induction system, and anyareas where dirt may enter thecomponent. Oil and filter change atthe time of sampling has been noted.Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. Elemental levels of silicon(Si) and aluminum (Al) indicatealumina-silicate (coarse dirt) ingress.The oil viscosity is lower than normal.The BN result indicates that there issuitable alkalinity remaining in the oil.Confirm oil type.

Depot: VOLVO0093Unique No: 10752972Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 23 Nov 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 06013828 (Generated: 11/23/2023 13:17:05) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN FARDELLA - VOLVO0093

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP432140 VCP395732 VCP340004 ---Sample Date 24 Oct 2023 08 Feb 2023 31 Aug 2022 ---Machine Hours 5943 5438 4966 ---Oil Hours 500 500 500 ---Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ---Sample Status ABNORMAL ATTENTION NORMAL ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.0 12.3 12.6 ---Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 9.3 9.5 9.7 ---Oxidation (PA) % 79 80 94 ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG ---Soot % % 0.4 0.3 0.5 ---Nitration (PA) % 64 68 89 ---Sulfation (PA) % 60 61 69 ---Glycol % NEG NEG NEG ---Fuel % <1.0 0.9 <1.0 ---Silicon ppm 23 5 4 ---Sodium ppm 3 2 3 ---Potassium ppm 0 0 <1 ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 20 19 20 ---Copper ppm 2 1 2 ---Lead ppm <1 1 1 ---Tin ppm 1 1 2 ---Aluminum ppm 6 2 4 ---Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 ---Molybdenum ppm 41 40 38 ---Nickel ppm 1 <1 0 ---Titanium ppm <1 0 <1 ---Silver ppm 0 0 <1 ---Manganese ppm 1 <1 <1 ---Vanadium ppm <1 0 <1 ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1572 1592 1522 ---Magnesium ppm 505 489 448 ---Zinc ppm 1086 1041 1027 ---Phosphorus ppm 904 843 846 ---Barium ppm 0 0 3 ---Boron ppm 33 29 18 ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 06013828 (Generated: 11/23/2023 13:17:09) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN FARDELLA - VOLVO0093
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A35G 340083\Diesel Engine [VCP432140] 24 Oct 2023 @ 5943.0 hrs

