
[[SW1024983 UPPER VALL]] VOLVO EC160D 220030 - FRONT LEFT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP435300
Oil Type: GL5
Job No: SW1024983 UPPER VALL

ARNOLD MACHINERY COMPANY3330 NORTH YELLOWSTONE HIGHWAYIDAHO FALLS, IDUS  83401Contact: JASON MERRILLjmerrill@arnoldmachinery.comT: (208)523-0822F: (208)523-9918
Diagnosis
We advise that you check all areaswhere dirt can enter the system. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.Gear wear isindicated. Elemental levels of silicon(Si) and aluminum (Al) indicatealumina-silicate (coarse dirt) ingress.The condition of the oil is acceptablefor the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0077Unique No: 10753439Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 24 Nov 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0077 [WUSCAR] 06014295 (Generated: 11/24/2023 12:37:32) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JASON MERRILL - VOLVO0077

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP435300 --- --- ---Sample Date 13 Nov 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 5506 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Not Changd --- --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 214 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 203 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 4 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 11 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 607 --- --- ---Copper ppm <1 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 30 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 4 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 355 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 2 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 4 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 38 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 15 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 9 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 611 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 18 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0077 [WUSCAR] 06014295 (Generated: 11/24/2023 12:37:34) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JASON MERRILL - VOLVO0077
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC160D 220030\Front Left Final Drive [VCP435300] 13 Nov 2023 @ 5506.0 hrs

