
[[SWA398817 COM METALS]] VOLVO EC350EL 314209 - REAR RIGHT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP429223
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 85W-140 GL-5
Job No: SWA398817 COM METALS

ALTA EQUIPMENT/FLAGLER CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT LLC8418 PALM RIVER ROADTAMPA, FLUS  33619Contact: JOHN FARDELLAjohn.fardella@altg.comT: (813)630-0077F: (813)630-2233
Diagnosis
We advise that you check all areaswhere dirt can enter the system. Theoil change at the time of samplinghas been noted. We advise that youinspect for the source(s) of wear. Werecommend an early resample tomonitor this condition.Gear wear isindicated. Elemental levels of silicon(Si) and aluminum (Al) indicatealumina-silicate (coarse dirt) ingress.The oil is no longer serviceable dueto the presence of contaminants.

Depot: VOLVO0093Unique No: 10753484Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 24 Nov 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 06014340 (Generated: 11/24/2023 12:54:42) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN FARDELLA - VOLVO0093

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP429223 --- --- ---Sample Date 27 Oct 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 2103 --- --- ---Oil Hours 1000 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status SEVERE --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 346 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 869 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 20 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 2286 --- --- ---Copper ppm 4 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm 0 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 249 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 20 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 2 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 3 --- --- ---Titanium ppm 19 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 19 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 35 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 7 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 0 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1126 --- --- ---Barium ppm 0 --- --- ---Boron ppm 148 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 06014340 (Generated: 11/24/2023 12:54:44) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN FARDELLA - VOLVO0093
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC350EL 314209\Rear Right Final Drive [VCP429223] 27 Oct 2023 @ 2103.0 hrs

