
[[131415 ROSE PROP MAI]] SDLG 640205 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCE197969
Oil Type: NAPA 10W30
Job No: 131415 ROSE PROP MAI

THE GW VAN KEPPEL CO MAIN1801 NORTH 9TH STREETKANSAS CITY, KSUS  66101Contact: RUSTY COONSrcoons@vankeppel.comT: (913)233-3881F: (913)281-4815
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0111Unique No: 10753556Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 24 Nov 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0111 [WUSCAR] 06014412 (Generated: 11/24/2023 14:42:20) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RUSTY COONS - VOLVO0111

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCE197969 --- --- ---Sample Date 31 Oct 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 92 --- --- ---Oil Hours 100 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 13.3 --- --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 45 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Soot % % 0.1 --- --- ---Nitration (PA) % 36 --- --- ---Sulfation (PA) % 49 --- --- ---Glycol % NEG --- --- ---Fuel % <1.0 --- --- ---Silicon ppm 18 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 2 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 3 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 7 --- --- ---Copper ppm 8 --- --- ---Lead ppm 1 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 3 --- --- ---Chromium ppm <1 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm 51 --- --- ---Nickel ppm 0 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 2 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1953 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 284 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1176 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 940 --- --- ---Barium ppm 3 --- --- ---Boron ppm 344 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0111 [WUSCAR] 06014412 (Generated: 11/24/2023 14:42:23) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RUSTY COONS - VOLVO0111
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	SDLG SDLG 640205\Diesel Engine [VCE197969] 31 Oct 2023 @ 92.0 hrs

