
[[729]] SENNEBOGEN 835E 835.0.2394 - FRONT AXLE

Sample No: VCP424153
Oil Type: MOBIL 75W90
Job No: 729

SIMS METAL130 NORTH 12TH STSACRAMENTO, CAUS  95814Contact: EVERT
T: (916)769-7864F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: SIMSACCAUnique No: 10754594Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 27 Nov 2023
Report Id: SIMSACCA [WUSCAR] 06015450 (Generated: 11/27/2023 14:04:28) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: EVERT ? - SIMSACCA

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP424153 VCP397628 VCP295745 VCP295744Sample Date 04 Nov 2023 07 Feb 2023 21 Dec 2020 21 Dec 2020Machine Hours 11082 9773 6211 6211Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Changed Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status NORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 135 145 141 138
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm <1 3 3 2Sodium ppm 0 0 1 <1Potassium ppm 2 10 0 2
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 1 7 38 3Copper ppm 8 31 78 49Lead ppm 0 <1 0 0Tin ppm 0 0 0 0Aluminum ppm 1 0 <1 <1Chromium ppm <1 0 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm <1 0 1 <1Nickel ppm 0 <1 <1 0Titanium ppm 0 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 59 6 5 6Magnesium ppm 4 1 1 2Zinc ppm 22 17 35 26Phosphorus ppm 934 984 904 923Barium ppm 0 0 21 6Boron ppm 157 212 146 157

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: SIMSACCA [WUSCAR] 06015450 (Generated: 11/27/2023 14:04:31) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: EVERT ? - SIMSACCA
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	SENNEBOGEN SENNEBOGEN 835E 835.0.2394\Front Axle [VCP424153] 04 Nov 2023 @ 11082.0 hrs

