
[[DIAMOND BACK SERVICE]] YANMAR UI055-6A JAH464 - COOLANT

Sample No: VCP412510
Oil Type: NOT GIVEN
Job No: DIAMOND BACK SERVICE

ROMCO INC1350 NE LOOP 820FORT WORTH, TXUS  76106Contact: CHRIS BITNERCBitner@romco.comT: F: (817)626-8983
Diagnosis
The fluid is suitable for furtherservice. There is no indication of anycontamination in the coolant. Glycoland nitrite levels are acceptable. ThepH level of this fluid is within theacceptable limits.

Depot: VOLVO0081Unique No: 10754720Signed: Jonathan HesterReport Date: 27 Nov 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0081 [WUSCAR] 06015576 (Generated: 11/27/2023 14:04:12) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CHRIS BITNER - VOLVO0081

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP412510 --- --- ---Sample Date 15 Nov 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 1967 --- --- ---Sample Status NORMAL --- --- ---
 COOLANT CONDITIONpH Scale 0-14 8.57 --- --- ---Reserve Alkalinity Scale 0-20 --- --- --- ---Nitrites ppm 600 --- --- ---Percentage Glycol % 54.1 --- --- ---Freezing Point °C -45 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONCoolant Appearance normal --- --- ---Coolant Color Green --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0081 [WUSCAR] 06015576 (Generated: 11/27/2023 14:04:14) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: CHRIS BITNER - VOLVO0081
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	YANMAR YANMAR UI055-6A JAH464\Coolant [VCP412510] 15 Nov 2023 @ 1967.1 hrs

