
[ASCENDUM MACHINERY [19890]] VOLVO L120H RL83 (S/N 633323) - REAR AXLE

Sample No: VCP443273
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER WET BRAKE TRANSAXLE OIL WB102
Job No: 19890

HILCO TRANSPORT7700 KENMONT RDGREENSBORO, NCUS  27409Contact: MIKE LAUGHEADmlaughead@hilcotransport.comT: (336)273-9441F: (336)273-9701
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Nocorrective action is recommended atthis time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.There is a light concentration ofwater present in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: HILGREVCUnique No: 10755906Signed: Sean FeltonReport Date: 28 Nov 2023
Report Id: HILGREVC [WUSCAR] 06016762 (Generated: 11/29/2023 21:33:25) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MIKE LAUGHEAD - HILGREVC

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP443273 VCP412005 --- ---Sample Date 14 Oct 2023 23 Jul 2023 --- ---Machine Hours 2347 1560 --- ---Oil Hours 0 1560 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Not Changd --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 40.9 42.0 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.338 NEG --- ---Silicon ppm 23 25 --- ---Sodium ppm 8 8 --- ---Potassium ppm 0 <1 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 153 189 --- ---Copper ppm <1 <1 --- ---Lead ppm <1 <1 --- ---Tin ppm 0 <1 --- ---Aluminum ppm <1 2 --- ---Chromium ppm 3 5 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 10 15 --- ---Nickel ppm 0 <1 --- ---Titanium ppm 0 0 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 10 13 --- ---Vanadium ppm 0 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3685 4010 --- ---Magnesium ppm 10 16 --- ---Zinc ppm 1597 1646 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1311 1340 --- ---Barium ppm 0 0 --- ---Boron ppm 123 133 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: HILGREVC [WUSCAR] 06016762 (Generated: 11/29/2023 21:33:29) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: MIKE LAUGHEAD - HILGREVC
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L120H RL83 (S/N 633323)\Rear Axle [VCP443273] 14 Oct 2023 @ 2347.0 hrs

