
[[9877 RITCHIE LAND]] ALJON 30116 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP422880
Oil Type: CHEVRON 15W40
Job No: 9877 RITCHIE LAND

PLEASANT EXCAVATING COMPANY INC24024 FREDERICK ROADCLARKSBURG, MDUS  20871Contact: H TRENTHTRENT@PLEASANTS.ORGT: (301)252-5635F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: PLECLAUnique No: 10756821Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 28 Nov 2023
Report Id: PLECLA [WUSCAR] 06017677 (Generated: 11/29/2023 17:19:14) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: H TRENT - PLECLA

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP422880 VCP407896 VCP395158 VCP369057Sample Date 22 Nov 2023 24 Jun 2023 28 Feb 2023 14 Dec 2022Machine Hours 5376 5062 4662 4234Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 13.3 13.2 13.0 13.0Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 7.2 7.5 7.7 8.7Oxidation (PA) % 63 63 62 68
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.1 0.1 0.1 0.1Nitration (PA) % 60 66 63 66Sulfation (PA) % 60 61 60 65Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 6 6 4 6Sodium ppm 2 0 2 5Potassium ppm 3 4 <1 2
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 3 5 4 4Copper ppm <1 1 <1 5Lead ppm <1 1 0 <1Tin ppm <1 <1 0 1Aluminum ppm 3 2 2 3Chromium ppm 0 0 0 <1Molybdenum ppm 72 74 78 93Nickel ppm 1 <1 0 <1Titanium ppm 2 <1 2 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1486 1614 1658 1601Magnesium ppm 384 394 418 505Zinc ppm 1248 1188 1169 1127Phosphorus ppm 1100 998 960 944Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 290 252 296 288

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: PLECLA [WUSCAR] 06017677 (Generated: 11/29/2023 17:19:17) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: H TRENT - PLECLA
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	ALJON ALJON 30116\Diesel Engine [VCP422880] 22 Nov 2023 @ 5376.0 hrs

