
[[9877 RITCHIE LAND]] ALJON 30116 - FRONT LEFT FINAL DRIVE

Sample No: VCP422881
Oil Type: DURALENE Dura-Gear 85W140
Job No: 9877 RITCHIE LAND

PLEASANT EXCAVATING COMPANY INC24024 FREDERICK ROADCLARKSBURG, MDUS  20871Contact: H TRENTHTRENT@PLEASANTS.ORGT: (301)252-5635F: 
Diagnosis
We advise that you inspect for thesource(s) of metal. Resample at thenext service interval to monitor.Highconcentration of visible metalpresent. All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: PLECLAUnique No: 10762993Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 30 Nov 2023
Report Id: PLECLA [WUSCAR] 06018493 (Generated: 11/30/2023 11:03:06) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: H TRENT - PLECLA

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP422881 VCP395148 VCP371314 VCP386437Sample Date 22 Nov 2023 28 Feb 2023 14 Dec 2022 12 Oct 2022Machine Hours 5376 4662 4234 3922Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Not Changd Changed Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status ABNORMAL SEVERE ABNORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 303 305 304 307
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 2 11 6 6Sodium ppm <1 0 0 <1Potassium ppm 0 3 1 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 312 2358 1473 1254Copper ppm 10 42 29 27Lead ppm 0 <1 0 0Tin ppm 6 0 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 0 4 3 <1Chromium ppm 3 31 20 15Molybdenum ppm 0 2 1 2Nickel ppm 0 4 2 2Titanium ppm 0 <1 0 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 2 15 10 9Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 69 20 12 18Magnesium ppm 0 1 <1 6Zinc ppm 25 16 11 15Phosphorus ppm 1032 714 570 561Barium ppm 0 <1 0 2Boron ppm 141 39 31 32

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: PLECLA [WUSCAR] 06018493 (Generated: 11/30/2023 11:03:09) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: H TRENT - PLECLA
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	ALJON ALJON 30116\Front Left Final Drive [VCP422881] 22 Nov 2023 @ 5376.0 hrs

