
[[9877 RITCHIE LAND]] ALJON 30116 - PUMP DRIVE

Sample No: VCP412685
Oil Type: MOBIL SHC 632
Job No: 9877 RITCHIE LAND

PLEASANT EXCAVATING COMPANY INC24024 FREDERICK ROADCLARKSBURG, MDUS  20871Contact: H TRENTHTRENT@PLEASANTS.ORGT: (301)252-5635F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Moderate concentration of visibledirt/debris present in the oil. Confirmoil type. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: PLECLAUnique No: 10762996Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 30 Nov 2023
Report Id: PLECLA [WUSCAR] 06018496 (Generated: 11/30/2023 11:05:12) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: H TRENT - PLECLA

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP412685 VCP395162 VCP371307 VCP386436Sample Date 22 Nov 2023 28 Feb 2023 14 Dec 2022 12 Oct 2022Machine Hours 5376 4662 4234 3922Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Not Changd Changed Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 151 148 152 154
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 15 9 8 10Sodium ppm <1 0 0 0Potassium ppm 0 <1 <1 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 61 23 17 30Copper ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Lead ppm 0 0 0 0Tin ppm <1 0 0 0Aluminum ppm 2 2 3 1Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 0 0 0 <1Nickel ppm 0 0 0 0Titanium ppm 0 0 0 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 2Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 6 7 7 2Magnesium ppm 0 <1 0 5Zinc ppm 11 10 9 13Phosphorus ppm 1658 1774 1558 1676Barium ppm 0 1 0 2Boron ppm 0 <1 0 0

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: PLECLA [WUSCAR] 06018496 (Generated: 11/30/2023 11:05:16) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: H TRENT - PLECLA
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	ALJON ALJON 30116\Pump Drive [VCP412685] 22 Nov 2023 @ 5376.0 hrs

