
[[9939]] VOLVO L50G 2420084 - REAR AXLE

Sample No: VCP388547
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER GEAR OIL 75W-80-GO102
Job No: 9939

RELIABLE CONTRACTING2410 EVERGREEN RD SUITE 200GAMBRILLS, MDUS  21054Contact: RUSSELL HATFIELDRHATFIELD@RELIABLECONTRACTING.COMT: (410)987-1851F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: RELMILUnique No: 10763009Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 30 Nov 2023
Report Id: RELMIL [WUSCAR] 06018509 (Generated: 11/30/2023 11:24:23) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RUSSELL HATFIELD - RELMIL

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP388547 VCP407792 VCP311352 VCP221426Sample Date 20 Nov 2023 04 May 2023 13 Jul 2021 06 Aug 2019Machine Hours 6883 6434 5217 4040Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 41.9 44.7 44.4 40.6
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 14 16 11 10Sodium ppm 2 6 3 0Potassium ppm 0 2 0 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 35 102 55 39Copper ppm <1 2 2 1Lead ppm <1 <1 <1 0Tin ppm <1 <1 <1 0Aluminum ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Chromium ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 2 4 2 0Nickel ppm 0 2 <1 1Titanium ppm 0 <1 <1 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 2 1 1Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3208 3755 3370 3483Magnesium ppm 17 82 40 4Zinc ppm 1425 1559 1341 1445Phosphorus ppm 1252 1215 1105 1188Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 46 117 131 104

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: RELMIL [WUSCAR] 06018509 (Generated: 11/30/2023 11:24:26) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RUSSELL HATFIELD - RELMIL
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L50G 2420084\Rear Axle [VCP388547] 20 Nov 2023 @ 6883.0 hrs

