
[[9939]] VOLVO L50G 2420084 - FRONT AXLE

Sample No: VCP388537
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER GEAR OIL 75W-80-GO102
Job No: 9939

RELIABLE CONTRACTING2410 EVERGREEN RD SUITE 200GAMBRILLS, MDUS  21054Contact: RUSSELL HATFIELDRHATFIELD@RELIABLECONTRACTING.COMT: (410)987-1851F: 
Diagnosis
We advise that you check for thesource of water entry. The oil changeat the time of sampling has beennoted. We recommend an earlyresample to monitor thiscondition.All component wear ratesare normal. There is a highconcentration of water present in theoil. The condition of the oil isacceptable for the time in service.

Depot: RELMILUnique No: 10763010Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 30 Nov 2023
Report Id: RELMIL [WUSCAR] 06018510 (Generated: 11/30/2023 11:24:13) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RUSSELL HATFIELD - RELMIL

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP388537 VCP408493 VCP323273 VCP223105Sample Date 20 Nov 2023 04 May 2023 13 Jul 2021 06 Aug 2019Machine Hours 6883 6434 5217 4040Oil Hours 0 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status ABNORMAL SEVERE ABNORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 41.2 89.0 44.1 40.7
 CONTAMINATIONWater % 0.709 10.5 0.563 0.833Silicon ppm 8 28 17 11Sodium ppm 2 5 2 5Potassium ppm 0 2 0 8
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 14 88 38 39Copper ppm 3 6 6 4Lead ppm 0 <1 <1 0Tin ppm <1 <1 <1 0Aluminum ppm 0 2 1 <1Chromium ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 0 4 2 <1Nickel ppm <1 4 2 2Titanium ppm 0 <1 <1 0Silver ppm 0 0 2 <1Manganese ppm 0 2 <1 5Vanadium ppm 0 <1 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 863 3565 2331 3131Magnesium ppm 3 69 28 2Zinc ppm 1383 1553 1317 1376Phosphorus ppm 1250 1209 1120 1207Barium ppm 0 0 0 1Boron ppm 23 129 90 113

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: RELMIL [WUSCAR] 06018510 (Generated: 11/30/2023 11:24:16) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: RUSSELL HATFIELD - RELMIL
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L50G 2420084\Front Axle [VCP388537] 20 Nov 2023 @ 6883.0 hrs

