
[[SW-26366-2 CASTLE]] VOLVO A40G 340313 - WET DISC BRAKE

Sample No: VCP441962
Oil Type: VOLVO WB 102
Job No: SW-26366-2 CASTLE

ARNOLD MACHINERY COMPANY2975 WEST 2100 SOUTHSALT LAKE CITY, UTUS  84119Contact: TJ LARKtlark@arnoldmachinery.comT: (801)972-4000F: (801)975-9434
Diagnosis
The fluid change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.The copper level is abnormal.All other component wear rates arenormal. There is no indication of anycontamination in the fluid. Thecondition of the fluid is acceptablefor the time in service.

Depot: VOLVO8770Unique No: 10763012Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 30 Nov 2023
Report Id: VOLVO8770 [WUSCAR] 06018512 (Generated: 11/30/2023 11:14:42) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TJ LARK - VOLVO8770

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP441962 VCP340953 VCP307912 VCP215893Sample Date 16 Nov 2023 23 Nov 2021 02 Apr 2021 13 Apr 2018Machine Hours 17580 13143 11646 5956Oil Hours 4000 0 0 0Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 42.4 35.6 41.4 40.6
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 12 14 9 21Sodium ppm 6 4 3 5Potassium ppm 0 0 <1 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 16 24 30 39Copper ppm 256 115 131 340Lead ppm 4 5 1 2Tin ppm <1 <1 0 0Aluminum ppm <1 0 2 1Chromium ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 0 <1 <1 0Nickel ppm <1 0 1 5Titanium ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 <1 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 1 1Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 <1
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3486 3562 3627 3247Magnesium ppm 13 11 12 6Zinc ppm 1423 1291 1542 1361Phosphorus ppm 1279 1259 1231 1205Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 114 114 128 84

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO8770 [WUSCAR] 06018512 (Generated: 11/30/2023 11:14:46) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TJ LARK - VOLVO8770
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40G 340313\Wet Disc Brake [VCP441962] 16 Nov 2023 @ 17580.0 hrs

