
CATERPILLAR M-2 - TRANSMISSION (MANUAL)

Sample No: VCP442920
Oil Type: SHELL SPIRAX S6 CXME 10W40
Job No:

MARYLAND ENVIRONMENTAL SERVICES21210 MARTINSBURG RDDICKERSON, MDUS  20842Contact: ALAN PARRISHaparr@menv.comT: (301)428-8185F: (301)428-8311
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Clutchand/or bushing/bearing wear isindicated. There is no indication ofany contamination in the fluid. Thecondition of the fluid is acceptablefor the time in service.

Depot: MARDICUnique No: 10763028Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 30 Nov 2023
Report Id: MARDIC [WUSCAR] 06018528 (Generated: 11/30/2023 11:55:44) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ALAN PARRISH - MARDIC

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP442920 VCP416557 VCP390145 VCP340098Sample Date 21 Nov 2023 25 Oct 2023 07 Mar 2023 05 Jan 2023Machine Hours 5984 5892 5507 5274Oil Hours 1991 1899 500 250Oil Changed Changed Not Changd Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 26.2 28.3 26.7 27.2
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG 0.150 NEG NEGSilicon ppm 3 24 3 4Sodium ppm 4 2 2 3Potassium ppm 0 0 0 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 34 37 29 18Copper ppm 361 354 310 299Lead ppm 17 20 19 19Tin ppm 6 6 5 6Aluminum ppm <1 1 <1 1Chromium ppm 0 0 0 <1Molybdenum ppm 2 2 2 2Nickel ppm 0 <1 0 5Titanium ppm 0 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 <1Manganese ppm <1 <1 1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 2471 2652 2571 2708Magnesium ppm 26 25 31 29Zinc ppm 994 1124 1013 1096Phosphorus ppm 889 802 803 873Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 3 4 5 4

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: MARDIC [WUSCAR] 06018528 (Generated: 11/30/2023 11:55:48) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: ALAN PARRISH - MARDIC
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	CATERPILLAR CATERPILLAR M-2\Transmission (Manual) [VCP442920] 21 Nov 2023 @ 5984.0 hrs

