
VOLVO A45G 353267 - TRANSMISSION (AUTO)

Sample No: VCP386694
Oil Type: VOLVO AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION FLUID AT102
Job No:

LEE MAR BUILDING & CONSTRUCTION15685 PINE RIDGE ROADFORT MYERS, FLUS  33908-2626Contact: JUDY GIBSONjgibson13@earthlink.netT: (239)481-2613F: (239)481-9354
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Moderate concentration of visibledirt/debris present in the fluid. Thecondition of the fluid is acceptablefor the time in service.

Depot: LEEFORUnique No: 10764326Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 01 Dec 2023
Report Id: LEEFOR [WUSCAR] 06019826 (Generated: 12/01/2023 15:42:52) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JUDY GIBSON - LEEFOR

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP386694 VCP423303 --- ---Sample Date 23 Nov 2023 10 Jul 2023 --- ---Machine Hours 1837 1257 --- ---Oil Hours 0 0 --- ---Oil Changed N/A Changed --- ---Sample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 28.1 29.0 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG --- ---Silicon ppm 17 18 --- ---Sodium ppm 7 <1 --- ---Potassium ppm 2 4 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 62 59 --- ---Copper ppm 36 32 --- ---Lead ppm <1 0 --- ---Tin ppm 4 4 --- ---Aluminum ppm 25 26 --- ---Chromium ppm <1 <1 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 0 <1 --- ---Nickel ppm 3 4 --- ---Titanium ppm <1 0 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 6 6 --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 64 75 --- ---Magnesium ppm 0 1 --- ---Zinc ppm 0 8 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 171 201 --- ---Barium ppm 0 2 --- ---Boron ppm 69 80 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: LEEFOR [WUSCAR] 06019826 (Generated: 12/01/2023 15:43:08) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JUDY GIBSON - LEEFOR
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A45G 353267\Transmission (Auto) [VCP386694] 23 Nov 2023 @ 1837.0 hrs

