
[[622085]] VOLVO A40G 352851 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP429242
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No: 622085

RIPA AND ASSOCIATES10149 FISHER AVENUETAMPA, FLUS  33619Contact: PM ServicesPMServices@ripaconstruction.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The BNresult indicates that there is suitablealkalinity remaining in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: RIPTAMUnique No: 10764745Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 30 Nov 2023
Report Id: RIPTAM [WUSCAR] 06020245 (Generated: 11/30/2023 09:32:32) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PM Services ? - RIPTAM

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP429242 VCP411553 VCP420265 VCP386668Sample Date 06 Nov 2023 12 Jul 2023 12 Apr 2023 07 Oct 2022Machine Hours 4099 3635 3090 2036Oil Hours 500 0 500 500Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.2 12.4 12.3 13.1Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 9.7 9.3 8.3 10.5Oxidation (PA) % 77 78 75 90
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.2 0.2 0.2 0.2Nitration (PA) % 64 67 64 75Sulfation (PA) % 59 58 54 69Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % <1.0 <1.0 0.5 <1.0Silicon ppm 4 5 5 8Sodium ppm 6 6 4 2Potassium ppm 3 1 0 2
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 2 5 6 8Copper ppm 3 2 4 41Lead ppm 0 0 0 <1Tin ppm <1 <1 0 1Aluminum ppm 1 0 1 3Chromium ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 43 45 45 45Nickel ppm 1 2 2 3Titanium ppm 0 <1 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 <1 0 <1
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1527 1757 1618 1744Magnesium ppm 499 518 517 498Zinc ppm 1090 1127 1100 1169Phosphorus ppm 907 947 927 963Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 32 31 40 24

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: RIPTAM [WUSCAR] 06020245 (Generated: 11/30/2023 09:32:35) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PM Services ? - RIPTAM
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40G 352851\Diesel Engine [VCP429242] 06 Nov 2023 @ 4099.0 hrs

