
[[A11488]] VOLVO L70H 622321 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP434160
Oil Type: MOBIL 15W40
Job No: A11488

K C CONSTRUCTION1737 STOUT DRIVEIVYLAND, PAUS  18974Contact: DUKE D.duked@kcconstruct.comT: (267)784-7337F:  x:
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Fuel content negligible. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil. The condition of the oil issuitable for further service.

Depot: KCCIVYUnique No: 10764788Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 01 Dec 2023
Report Id: KCCIVY [WUSCAR] 06020288 (Generated: 12/01/2023 08:37:45) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DUKE D. - KCCIVY

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP434160 VCP294654 VCP287934 VCP235626Sample Date 17 Nov 2023 23 Nov 2021 06 Oct 2020 22 Jan 2019Machine Hours 3525 2985 2460 1900Oil Hours 500 500 500 500Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.3 12.6 13.1 13.51Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 9.0 9.7 --- ---Oxidation (PA) % 78 78 71 85
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.2 0.2 0.2 0.7Nitration (PA) % 72 69 59 83Sulfation (PA) % 57 60 58 60Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % 0.8 <1.0 <1.0 <1.0Silicon ppm 10 7 7 8Sodium ppm 3 0 <1 5Potassium ppm <1 <1 1 1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 14 15 14 32Copper ppm 2 2 2 4Lead ppm 0 0 0 0Tin ppm <1 <1 <1 1Aluminum ppm 27 19 16 16Chromium ppm 2 2 1 2Molybdenum ppm 42 55 32 43Nickel ppm 0 0 0 <1Titanium ppm 0 <1 <1 0Silver ppm 0 <1 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 <1 <1Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1555 1775 1535 1706Magnesium ppm 482 531 482 543Zinc ppm 1027 1019 962 895Phosphorus ppm 870 926 823 767Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 52 74 72 30

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: KCCIVY [WUSCAR] 06020288 (Generated: 12/01/2023 08:37:48) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: DUKE D. - KCCIVY
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L70H 622321\Diesel Engine [VCP434160] 17 Nov 2023 @ 3525.0 hrs

