
VOLVO A25G 752074 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP443052
Oil Type: VOLVO ULTRA DIESEL ENGINE OIL 15W40 VDS-3
Job No:

JR DAVIS CONSTRUCTION COMPANY INC210 S HOAGLAND BLVDKISSIMMEE, FLUS  34741Contact: TOMMY MASTERSjrshop@jr-davis.comT: (321)219-0164F: 
Diagnosis
No corrective action is recommendedat this time. Resample at the nextservice interval to monitor.Allcomponent wear rates are normal.Fuel content negligible. There is noindication of any contamination inthe oil. The BN result indicates thatthere is suitable alkalinity remainingin the oil. The condition of the oil issuitable for further service.

Depot: JRDKISUnique No: 10764790Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 01 Dec 2023
Report Id: JRDKIS [WUSCAR] 06020290 (Generated: 12/01/2023 08:37:34) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TOMMY MASTERS - JRDKIS

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP443052 VCP398066 VCP362889 VCP314707Sample Date 28 Nov 2023 06 Mar 2023 13 May 2022 28 Apr 2021Machine Hours 4301 3204 2145 522Oil Hours 0 0 0 522Oil Changed Changed Changed Changed ChangedSample Status NORMAL NORMAL ABNORMAL ABNORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 12.4 12.8 12.7 11.8Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 10.0 10.1 10.5 ---Oxidation (PA) % 82 79 87 72
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.3 0.3 1.2 0.2Nitration (PA) % 62 65 81 62Sulfation (PA) % 61 61 71 60Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % 0.4 <1.0 <1.0 0.4Silicon ppm 4 2 4 27Sodium ppm 4 0 1 3Potassium ppm <1 <1 0 11
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 3 6 12 19Copper ppm <1 <1 29 381Lead ppm 0 0 <1 <1Tin ppm <1 0 2 0Aluminum ppm 1 0 2 2Chromium ppm 0 0 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm 37 42 49 54Nickel ppm 0 0 <1 <1Titanium ppm 0 0 <1 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 2Manganese ppm <1 0 <1 4Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1560 1652 1714 1164Magnesium ppm 481 427 529 854Zinc ppm 1057 1053 1046 1153Phosphorus ppm 899 899 922 951Barium ppm 0 <1 0 0Boron ppm 29 52 65 16

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: JRDKIS [WUSCAR] 06020290 (Generated: 12/01/2023 08:37:38) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: TOMMY MASTERS - JRDKIS
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A25G 752074\Diesel Engine [VCP443052] 28 Nov 2023 @ 4301.0 hrs

