
[[A11483]] VOLVO EC480DL 210065 - DIESEL ENGINE

Sample No: VCP431240
Oil Type: MOBIL 15W40
Job No: A11483

JAMES J ANDERSON6958 TORRESDALE AVENUEPHILADELPHIA, PAUS  19135Contact: JOHN HERBUTherb@jjaconstruction.comT: (215)850-9051F: (215)427-0208
Diagnosis
Oil and filter change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The oilviscosity is lower than normal. TheBN result indicates that there issuitable alkalinity remaining in the oil.Confirm oil type.

Depot: JAAPHIUnique No: 10764802Signed: Angela BorellaReport Date: 01 Dec 2023
Report Id: JAAPHI [WUSCAR] 06020302 (Generated: 12/01/2023 13:56:54) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN HERBUT - JAAPHI

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP431240 VCP421863 VCP416829 VCP399150Sample Date 09 Nov 2023 26 Aug 2023 07 Jun 2023 13 Jan 2023Machine Hours 8530 8275 8066 7764Oil Hours 250 250 0 0Oil Changed Changed Changed N/A ChangedSample Status ABNORMAL NORMAL NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 100°C cSt 11.8 12.4 12.4 12.5Base Number (BN) mg KOH/g 7.7 9.8 9.7 9.0Oxidation (PA) % 47 78 86 55
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSoot % % 0.2 0.2 0.2 0.2Nitration (PA) % 58 53 57 60Sulfation (PA) % 46 59 62 50Glycol % NEG NEG NEG NEGFuel % 2.0 <1.0 1.6 <1.0Silicon ppm 3 5 3 4Sodium ppm 2 4 2 0Potassium ppm <1 0 1 <1
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 3 4 2 4Copper ppm 1 2 0 <1Lead ppm 1 <1 0 2Tin ppm <1 <1 0 <1Aluminum ppm 1 4 10 2Chromium ppm 0 0 0 <1Molybdenum ppm 24 41 39 36Nickel ppm <1 0 0 <1Titanium ppm <1 <1 0 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm <1 <1 0 <1Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 1872 1783 1731 1717Magnesium ppm 319 518 531 408Zinc ppm 1118 1107 1177 1129Phosphorus ppm 893 966 944 913Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 10 51 38 16

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: JAAPHI [WUSCAR] 06020302 (Generated: 12/01/2023 13:56:58) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: JOHN HERBUT - JAAPHI
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO EC480DL 210065\Diesel Engine [VCP431240] 09 Nov 2023 @ 8530.0 hrs

