
[[622085]] VOLVO A40G 352851 - HYDRAULIC SYSTEM

Sample No: VCP424417
Oil Type: VOLVO SUPER HYDRAULIC OIL 46
Job No: 622085

RIPA AND ASSOCIATES10149 FISHER AVENUETAMPA, FLUS  33619Contact: PM ServicesPMServices@ripaconstruction.comT: F: 
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. The system cleanliness isacceptable for your target ISO 4406cleanliness code. The system andfluid cleanliness is acceptable. TheAN level is acceptable for this fluid.The condition of the oil is suitable forfurther service.

Depot: RIPTAMUnique No: 10765004Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 30 Nov 2023
Report Id: RIPTAM [WUSCAR] 06020504 (Generated: 11/30/2023 09:40:00) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PM Services ? - RIPTAM

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP424417 VCP420260 VCP385558 VCP356627Sample Date 06 Nov 2023 12 Apr 2023 07 Oct 2022 17 Mar 2022Machine Hours 4099 3090 2036 1095Oil Hours 4099 3090 1500 1095Oil Changed Changed Not Changd Not Changd Not ChangdSample Status NORMAL ATTENTION ATTENTION NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 44.2 44.4 44.8 44.7Acid Number (AN) mg KOH/g 0.31 0.42 0.38 0.39
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGParticles >4µm 402 5692 14010 9973Particles >6µm 89 2007 2856 1599Particles >14µm 8 166 246 81ISO 4406:1999 (c) 16/14/10 20/18/15 21/19/15 20/18/14Silicon ppm 7 6 6 6Sodium ppm 0 <1 1 <1Potassium ppm 2 0 0 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 11 9 7 5Copper ppm 4 2 2 2Lead ppm 4 2 3 1Tin ppm <1 0 <1 <1Aluminum ppm 2 0 <1 <1Chromium ppm <1 0 <1 <1Molybdenum ppm <1 0 <1 0Nickel ppm <1 0 0 0Titanium ppm <1 0 0 0Silver ppm 0 0 0 <1Manganese ppm <1 0 <1 0Vanadium ppm 0 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 68 67 58 60Magnesium ppm 2 0 0 0Zinc ppm 436 442 440 431Phosphorus ppm 283 331 339 350Barium ppm 0 0 0 0Boron ppm 0 0 0 1

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: RIPTAM [WUSCAR] 06020504 (Generated: 11/30/2023 09:40:04) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: PM Services ? - RIPTAM
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40G 352851\Hydraulic System [VCP424417] 06 Nov 2023 @ 4099.0 hrs

