
[[SPM633258 CADILLAC A]] VOLVO L25H 1420331 - FRONT AXLE

Sample No: VCP409065
Oil Type: GEAR OIL SAE 80W90
Job No: SPM633258 CADILLAC A

ALTA CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT LLCG-3283 S. DORT HIGHWAYBURTON, MIUS  48529Contact: BURTON SERVICEBURTON.SERVICE@ALTAEQUIPMENT.COMT: F: 
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The oilviscosity is lower than normal. Thisplus the additive levels indicates theaddition of a different brand, or typeof oil. Confirm oil type.

Depot: VOLVO5023Unique No: 10765246Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 03 Dec 2023
Report Id: VOLVO5023 [WUSCAR] 06020746 (Generated: 12/03/2023 09:53:02) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BURTON SERVICE - VOLVO5023

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP409065 --- --- ---Sample Date 17 Nov 2023 --- --- ---Machine Hours 1509 --- --- ---Oil Hours 0 --- --- ---Oil Changed Changed --- --- ---Sample Status ATTENTION --- --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 62.9 --- --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG --- --- ---Silicon ppm 15 --- --- ---Sodium ppm 21 --- --- ---Potassium ppm 3 --- --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 297 --- --- ---Copper ppm 2 --- --- ---Lead ppm 0 --- --- ---Tin ppm <1 --- --- ---Aluminum ppm 2 --- --- ---Chromium ppm 5 --- --- ---Molybdenum ppm <1 --- --- ---Nickel ppm <1 --- --- ---Titanium ppm <1 --- --- ---Silver ppm 0 --- --- ---Manganese ppm 12 --- --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 --- --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 3295 --- --- ---Magnesium ppm 11 --- --- ---Zinc ppm 1338 --- --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1106 --- --- ---Barium ppm 1 --- --- ---Boron ppm 114 --- --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO5023 [WUSCAR] 06020746 (Generated: 12/03/2023 09:53:05) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: BURTON SERVICE - VOLVO5023
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO L25H 1420331\Front Axle [VCP409065] 17 Nov 2023 @ 1509.0 hrs

