
[[633079]] VOLVO A40G 341352 - DROP BOX

Sample No: VCP385134
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 85W-140 GL-5
Job No: 633079

ALTA EQUIPMENT/FLAGLER CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT LLC8418 PALM RIVER ROADTAMPA, FLUS  33619Contact: KENNY HANEYkhaney@flaglerce.comT: (813)630-0077F: (813)630-2233
Diagnosis
The oil change at the time ofsampling has been noted. Resampleat the next service interval tomonitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. The oilviscosity is lower than normal.Confirm oil type.

Depot: VOLVO0093Unique No: 10765271Signed: Don BaldridgeReport Date: 03 Dec 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 06020771 (Generated: 12/03/2023 10:25:18) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KENNY HANEY - VOLVO0093

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP385134 VCP406403 VCP310795 VCP293104Sample Date 08 Nov 2023 01 Feb 2023 29 Apr 2021 07 Oct 2020Machine Hours 8415 7996 5966 5154Oil Hours 4000 0 800 0Oil Changed Changed Not Changd Not Changd ChangedSample Status ATTENTION ATTENTION NORMAL NORMAL
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 65.7 65.8 224 55.1
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG NEG NEGSilicon ppm 16 33 1 20Sodium ppm 2 <1 <1 4Potassium ppm 0 0 <1 0
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 81 149 18 86Copper ppm 1 <1 <1 <1Lead ppm 0 0 0 <1Tin ppm <1 0 0 0Aluminum ppm 2 5 <1 5Chromium ppm 2 3 <1 1Molybdenum ppm 4 6 4 2Nickel ppm 0 0 0 <1Titanium ppm 0 <1 0 <1Silver ppm 0 0 0 0Manganese ppm 1 2 <1 1Vanadium ppm <1 0 0 0
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 164 122 124 1771Magnesium ppm 15 19 29 34Zinc ppm 76 76 69 684Phosphorus ppm 520 579 949 1048Barium ppm <1 0 0 0Boron ppm 89 110 170 157

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 06020771 (Generated: 12/03/2023 10:25:22) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KENNY HANEY - VOLVO0093
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A40G 341352\Drop Box [VCP385134] 08 Nov 2023 @ 8415.0 hrs

