
[[621714 TUCKER]] VOLVO A25G 752447 - REAR AXLE

Sample No: VCP429925
Oil Type: VOLVO PREMIUM GEAR OIL 85W-140 GL-5
Job No: 621714 TUCKER

ALTA EQUIPMENT/FLAGLER CONSTRUCTION EQUIPMENT LLC8418 PALM RIVER ROADTAMPA, FLUS  33619Contact: KENNY HANEYkhaney@flaglerce.comT: (813)630-0077F: (813)630-2233
Diagnosis
Resample at the next service intervalto monitor.All component wear ratesare normal. There is no indication ofany contamination in the oil. Thecondition of the oil is acceptable forthe time in service.

Depot: VOLVO0093Unique No: 10765272Signed: Wes DavisReport Date: 30 Nov 2023
Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 06020772 (Generated: 11/30/2023 12:33:07) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KENNY HANEY - VOLVO0093

 SAMPLE INFORMATIONSample Number VCP429925 VCP389363 --- ---Sample Date 31 Oct 2023 24 Oct 2022 --- ---Machine Hours 2238 504 --- ---Oil Hours 1500 500 --- ---Oil Changed Changed Not Changd --- ---Sample Status NORMAL ATTENTION --- ---
 OIL CONDITIONVisc @ 40°C cSt 235 90.3 --- ---
 CONTAMINATIONWater % NEG NEG --- ---Silicon ppm 3 5 --- ---Sodium ppm 2 <1 --- ---Potassium ppm 2 <1 --- ---
 WEAR METALSIron ppm 96 200 --- ---Copper ppm 13 18 --- ---Lead ppm 0 0 --- ---Tin ppm <1 <1 --- ---Aluminum ppm 0 <1 --- ---Chromium ppm 2 5 --- ---Molybdenum ppm 6 17 --- ---Nickel ppm 1 2 --- ---Titanium ppm 0 0 --- ---Silver ppm 0 0 --- ---Manganese ppm 3 9 --- ---Vanadium ppm <1 0 --- ---
 ADDITIVESCalcium ppm 194 870 --- ---Magnesium ppm 6 3 --- ---Zinc ppm 95 353 --- ---Phosphorus ppm 1049 1298 --- ---Barium ppm <1 2 --- ---Boron ppm 172 241 --- ---

Page 1 of 2



 GRAPHS

Report Id: VOLVO0093 [WUSCAR] 06020772 (Generated: 11/30/2023 12:33:10) Rev: 1 Contact/Location: KENNY HANEY - VOLVO0093
Page 2 of 2

Powered by TCPDF (www.tcpdf.org)

http://www.tcpdf.org

	VOLVO VOLVO A25G 752447\Rear Axle [VCP429925] 31 Oct 2023 @ 2238.0 hrs

